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 JACKSON PUBLIC SCHOOL DISTRICT 

Jackson, Mississippi 
Date:  September 05, 2023 

Board of Trustees 
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Bid 3240 (07-18-23) Computer & Technology Devices 
Funding Source: Various 
Recommendation:  Mrs. Erin Mason  

 
 Vendor Location Abbreviation  

N Academic Technologies, Inc. Ridgeland, MS Academic 

 Archangel Tablets   

N CDWG Chicago, IL CDW 

 Clary   

N Howard Technology Solutions Laural, MS Howard 

 Jackson Business   

M KIBS Corp. Columbus, MS KIBS 

 Platinum Micro   

N Riverside Technologies, Inc. North Sioux City, SD Riverside 

 RJ Young   

N Synergetics DCS, Inc. Starkville, MS Synergetics 

N Trafera, LLC Saint Paul, MN Trafera 

 

Vendor 
Item 

Number 
Description 

 Bid 
Price  

CDWG 1 HP X3601040G10 I5-1335U 512 16 $1,201.00  

KIBS 1 Notebook ThinkPad X1 Yoga Gen 8  $1,619.00  

Riverside 
Technologies 1 Notebook ThinkPad X1 Yoga Gen 8  $1,894.00  

Jackson Business 1 Notebook ThinkPad X1 Yoga Gen 8   No Bid  

Howard 1 Notebook ThinkPad X1 Yoga Gen 8   No Bid  

Trafera 1 Notebook ThinkPad X1 Yoga Gen 8   No Bid  

RJ Young 1 Notebook ThinkPad X1 Yoga Gen 8   No Bid  

Platinum Micro 1 Notebook ThinkPad X1 Yoga Gen 8   No Bid  

Clary 1 Notebook ThinkPad X1 Yoga Gen 8   No Bid  

Academic 
Technologies 1 Notebook ThinkPad X1 Yoga Gen 8   No Bid  

Archangel Tablets 1 Notebook ThinkPad X1 Yoga Gen 8   No Bid  

Synergetics DCS 1 Notebook ThinkPad X1 Yoga Gen 8   No Bid  

 
The warranty for the alternate device proposed by CDWG includes only one ADP repair 
for the coverage of the device. The bid specifications required unlimited repairs. 
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Vendor 
Bid 

Number Description 
 Bid 

Price  

CDWG 2 HP 840 G10 I5-1335U 512 16 $911.00  

KIBS 2 Notebook ThinkPad T14 Gen 4 $1,246.00  

Riverside 
Technologies 2 Notebook ThinkPad T14 Gen 4 

 $ 
1,494.00  
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Vendor 
Bid 

Number Description 
 Bid 

Price  

Clary 11 

OneScreen TL7-65 (Includes Electric 
Height Adjustable Mobile cart) $2,495.00  

Academic 
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Vendor 
Bid 

Number Description 
 Bid 

Price  

Trafera 13 ActivePanel LX Option $1,685.00  

Clary 13 
OneScreen TL7-65 (Includes fixed Wall 
Mount $1,795.00  

Trafera 13 
Promethean ActivPanel9- AP9 – 65” 
4K $2,090.00  

Synergetics DCS 13 Promethean ActivPanel9- AP9 – 65” 4K $2,276.18  

Jackson Business 13 Promethean ActivPanel9- AP9 – 65” 4K  No Bid  

KIBS 13 Promethean ActivPanel9- AP9 – 65” 4K  No Bid  

Howard 13 Promethean ActivPanel9- AP9 – 65” 4K  No Bid  

RJ Young 13 Promethean ActivPanel9- AP9 – 65” 4K  No Bid  

Platinum Micro 13 Promethean ActivPanel9- AP9 – 65” 4K  No Bid  

Academic 
Technologies 13 

Promethean ActivPanel9- AP9 – 65” 4K 
 No Bid  

Riverside 
Technologies 13 

Promethean ActivPanel9- AP9 – 65” 4K 
 No Bid  

CDWG 13 Promethean ActivPanel9- AP9 – 65” 4K  No Bid  

Archangel Tablets 13 Promethean ActivPanel9- AP9 – 65” 4K  No Bid  

 
Clary did not include detailed quotes as required by the bid specifications. 
 
The alternate ActivePanel LX proposed by Trafera did not meet the bid specifications. 
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Vendor 
Bid 

Number Description 
 Bid 

Price  

CDWG 17 Newline 65" 4K UHD LED $1,913.85  

Clary 17 
OneScreen TL7-65 (Includes Electric Height 
Adjustable Mobile cart) $2,495.00  

Trafera 17 ActivePanel LX Option $2,684.00  

Trafera 17 

Promethean ActivPanel9- AP9 – 65” 4K 
(includes mobile electric height 
adjustable stand) $3,089.00  

Synergetics 
DCS 17 

Promethean ActivPanel9- AP9 – 65” 4K 
(includes mobile electric height adjustable 
stand) $3,348.18  

Jackson 
Business 17 

Promethean ActivPanel9- AP9 – 65” 4K 
(includes mobile electric height adjustable 
stand)  No Bid  

KIBS 17 

Promethean ActivPanel9- AP9 – 65” 4K 
(includes mobile electric height adjustable 
stand)  No Bid  

Howard 17 

Promethean ActivPanel9- AP9 – 65” 4K 
(includes mobile electric height adjustable 
stand)  No Bid  

RJ Young 17 

Promethean ActivPanel9- AP9 – 65” 4K 
(includes mobile electric height adjustable 
stand)  No Bid  

Platinum Micro 17 

Promethean ActivPanel9- AP9 – 65” 4K 
(includes mobile electric height adjustable 
stand)  No Bid  

Academic 
Technologies 17 

Promethean ActivPanel9- AP9 – 65” 4K 
(includes mobile electric height adjustable 
stand)  No Bid  

Riverside 
Technologies 17 

Promethean ActivPanel9- AP9 – 65” 4K 
(includes mobile electric height adjustable 
stand)  No Bid  

Archangel 
Tablets 17 

Promethean ActivPanel9- AP9 – 65” 4K 
(includes mobile electric height adjustable 
stand)  No Bid  
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Vendor 
Bid 

Number Description 
 Bid 

Price  

CDWG 18 
Newline 75" 4K UHD LED 

$2,338.85  

Clary 18 

OneScreen TL7-75 (Includes Electric Height 
Adjustable Mobile cart) $2,595.00  

Trafera 18 
ActivePanel LX Option 

$3,029.00  

Trafera 18 

Promethean ActivPanel9- AP9 – 75” 4K 
(includes mobile electric height adjustable 
stand) $3,859.00  

Synergetics DCS 18 

Promethean ActivPanel9- AP9 – 75” 4K 
(includes mobile electric height adjustable 
stand) $3,936.41  

Jackson 
Business 18 

Promethean ActivPanel9- AP9 – 75” 4K 
(includes mobile electric height adjustable 
stand)  No Bid  

KIBS 18 

Promethean ActivPanel9- AP9 – 75” 4K 
(includes mobile electric height adjustable 
stand)  No Bid  

Howard 18 

Promethean ActivPanel9- AP9 – 75” 4K 
(includes mobile electric height adjustable 
stand)  No Bid  

RJ Young 18 

Promethean ActivPanel9- AP9 – 75” 4K 
(includes mobile electric height adjustable 
stand)  No Bid  

Platinum Micro 18 

Promethean ActivPanel9- AP9 – 75” 4K 
(includes mobile electric height adjustable 
stand)  No Bid  

Academic 
Technologies 18 

Promethean ActivPanel9- AP9 – 75” 4K 
(includes mobile electric height adjustable 
stand)  No Bid  

Riverside 
Technologies 18 

Promethean ActivPanel9- AP9 – 75” 4K 
(includes mobile electric height adjustable 
stand)  No Bid  

Archangel 
Tablets 18 

Promethean ActivPanel9- AP9 – 75” 4K 
(includes mobile electric height adjustable 
stand)  No Bid  

 
CDWG did not include detailed quotes required by the bid specifications. 
 
Clary did not include detailed quotes as required by the bid specifications. 
 
The alternate ActivePanel LX proposed by Trafera did not meet the bid specifications. 
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Vendor 
Bid 

Number Description 
 Bid 
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Vendor 
Bid 

Number Description 
 Bid 

Price  

CDWG 22 
45W Lenovo Chromebook 45W USB-
C Adapter   $28.06  

Howard 22 
45W Lenovo Chromebook 45W USB-C 
Adapter   $30.00  

KIBS 22 
45W Lenovo Chromebook 45W USB-C 
Adapter   $36.00  

Riverside 
Technologies 22 

45W Lenovo Chromebook 45W USB-C 
Adapter   $49.15  

Synergetics DCS 22 
45W Lenovo Chromebook 45W USB-C 
Adapter   $53.52  

Jackson Business 22 
45W Lenovo Chromebook 45W USB-C 
Adapter   No Bid  

Trafera 22 
45W Lenovo Chromebook 45W USB-C 
Adapter   No Bid  

RJ Young 22 
45W Lenovo Chromebook 45W USB-C 
Adapter   No Bid  

Platinum Micro 22 
45W Lenovo Chromebook 45W USB-C 
Adapter   No Bid  

Clary 22 
45W Lenovo Chromebook 45W USB-C 
Adapter   No Bid  
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Vendor 
Bid 

Number Description 
 Bid 

Price  

CDWG 24 
LocknCharge Joey 30 Charging Cart 
Bundle – Includes six large baskets   $979.78  

Howard 24 
LocknCharge Joey 30 Charging Cart 
Bundle – Includes six large baskets  $1,019.00  

Jackson Business 24 
LocknCharge Joey 30 Charging Cart 
Bundle – Includes six large baskets   No Bid  

KIBS 24 
LocknCharge Joey 30 Charging Cart 
Bundle – Includes six large baskets   No Bid  

Trafera 24 
LocknCharge Joey 30 Charging Cart 
Bundle – Includes six large baskets   No Bid  

RJ Young 24 
LocknCharge Joey 30 Charging Cart 
Bundle – Includes six large baskets   No Bid  

Platinum Micro 24 
LocknCharge Joey 30 Charging Cart 
Bundle – Includes six large baskets   No Bid  

Clary 24 
LocknCharge Joey 30 Charging Cart 
Bundle – Includes six large baskets   No Bid  

Academic 
Technologies 24 

LocknCharge Joey 30 Charging Cart 
Bundle – Includes six large baskets   No Bid  

Riverside 
Technologies 24 

LocknCharge Joey 30 Charging Cart 
Bundle – Includes six large baskets   No Bid  

Archangel Tablets 24 
LocknCharge Joey 30 Charging Cart 
Bundle – Includes six large baskets   No Bid  

Synergetics DCS 24 
LocknCharge Joey 30 Charging Cart 
Bundle – Includes six large baskets   No Bid  
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Vendor 
Bid 

Number Description 
 Bid 

Price  

CDWG 27 


